
20 Suncroft Drive Lalor, VIC 5 2 4

BOUTIQUE 5 BEDROOM FAMILY HOME
Located in the exclusive CARLINGFORD ESTATE  this beautiful, quality
built boutique home is a family haven designed for comfort, space and
enjoyment where an enviable lifestyle awaits in a prized location to match.
Just minutes to local schools, shops, bus routes, easy reach to Lalor Train
Station, Pacific Plaza Epping, Health Services, recreational parklands and
major road arterials.
Experience the luxury of this immaculately presented home, showcasing
style and sophistication enhanced by architectural features,
complemented by a well zoned generous floor plan with an abundance of
features and modern living at its best ideal for families with growing needs
with plenty of room for everyone to have their own space. Boasting
multiple formal and informal living options including lounge room, separate
dining room, 5 bedrooms with built in robes, large master bedroom with
walk in robe and sumptuous ensuite with corner spa bath, luxurious family
bathroom and well fitted laundry. The heart of family living, entertaining
and gatherings will be around the stunning, stone finished kitchen with
white cabinetry, equipped with stainless steel appliances, 900mm
cooktop/wall oven, L shaped breakfast bench that incorporates
meals/dining area with bonus family/rumpus room or perhaps a fabulous
sun /living room.

Price: AUCTION THIS SATURDAY AT 1:30PM
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